
 
  

 

 
"This institution is an equal opportunity provider, and employer.  To file a complaint of discrimination, write: USDA, Director, Office of Civil 

Rights, 1400 Independence Avenue, S.W., Washington, D.C. 20250-9410, or call (800) 795-3272 (voice) or (202) 720-6382 (TDD)." 

 

Town of Clayton 
405 Riverside Drive 

Clayton, New York 13624 
Telephone: (315) 686-3512 

Fax: (315) 686-2651 
www.townofclayton.com 

Town Supervisor 
Lance Peterson  
Town Board Members 
Kenneth Knapp 
Donna J. Patchen 
James Kenney 
Kathleen LaClair 
 

Town Clerk 
Megan Badour  

   TOWN BOARD REGULAR MEETING AGENDA 
Wednesday, December 13, 2023 • 5:00pm • Town Hall 

 

1. Pledge of Allegiance 
 

2. Guests:   
 

3. Town Clerk 
A. Correspondence that Needs Recording 
B. Minutes from 11/08/2023 Meeting 

 

4. Public: Comment on Agenda Items 
 

5. General Discussion Items: 
A. Bills & Transfers 

i. Abstract #12 of 2023 in the amount of $188,563.82 
ii. Transfers: $91,702.18 from Debt Reserve to General Checking for Dock Debt Payment 

iii. Budget Amendment: N/A 
iv. New Accounts/Special Entries: N/A 

B. Supervisor’s Report & Bank Reconciliations: November 2023 
C. Balance Sheets: November 2023 
D. Resignations, Appointments & Rate Changes 

i. Resignations & Appointments:  
a. Rylee Babcock-Deputy Town Clerk $18/hr effective 11/29/23 
b. Mark Natali Sr.- Resignation effective 12/17/23 

ii. Rate Changes: N/A 
E. Training:  

i. N/A 
F. CLDC Board Appointments: 

i. Jack Stopper- Reappointment   
ii. Norma Zimmer- Appointed  

 

6. Supervisor’s Report: Highway, Consolidated Health District, Youth Commission & Antique Boat Museum 
 

7. Department Head Reports:   
A. Highway Superintendent: Steve Dorr 
B. Buildings & Grounds: James Jones 
C. Codes/Zoning: Richard Ingerson 

 

8. Council Reports: 
A. Councilman Knapp: Libraries & Chamber of Commerce 
B. Councilwoman Patchen: Buildings & Grounds, Cemeteries, and Purchasing & Personnel 
C. Councilman Kenney: Safety Coordinator, Planning/Zoning, and Sewer Districts 
D. Councilwoman LaClair: TIERS, Paynter Center and CLDC 

 

9. Public:  Submitted Requests to Address the Board 
 
 

10. Adjournment        
Next Board Meeting:  Friday, December 29, 2023 @ 8:00am 





Town of Clayton Regular Meeting Minutes 
 

Wednesday, November 8, 2023 
 

The Town Board of the Town of Clayton held their regular meeting at 5:00 PM, at Cerow Recreation 
Park, 600 East Line Rd., Clayton, NY.  
 
The following persons attended: 
 
Lance Peterson   Kenneth Knapp    Megan Badour   James Jones  
Kathleen LaClair  James Kenney   Alicia Dewey   Donna Patchen 
Pamela McDowell  Steve Dorr, Sr.   Michael Patchen Mariah LaClair 
    
1. Pledge of Allegiance: Supervisor Peterson opened the meeting with the Pledge of Allegiance  
 
2. Guests: N/A 
 
3. Town Clerk:  
A. Correspondence: N/A 
B. Minutes: Will be submitted at the next meeting with appropriate revisions.  

 
4. Public: No comment on agenda items. 
 
5. General Discussion Items: 

A. Bills and Transfers: 
 i. Abstract #11 of 2023 
 Motion was made by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by James Kenney, to approve Abstract 
 #11, in the amount of $1,289,349.25. Motion carried. 
 ii. Transfers: N/A 
 iii. Budget Amendment: N/A 
 iv. New Accounts/Special Entries: N/A 
B. Supervisor’s Report & Bank Reconciliations: 
Motion was made by Donna Patchen, seconded by Kathleen LaClair to approve October 2023 
Supervisor’s report. Motion carried. 
C. Balance Sheets: October 2023 
D. Resignations; Appointments & Rate Changes: 
 i. Resignations: N/A 
 ii. Positions/Appointments:  

a. Planning Board Alternates: 
1. Motion to appoint Adam Powers as Planning Board member, to replace 
Patrick Dewey, for a 7-year term effective 1/1/2024 to 12/31/2030 pending 
Village Board approval by James Kenney, seconded by Kenneth Knapp. Motion 
carried. 
2. Motion to appoint Alson Taylor as Planning Board Alternate, effective 
immediately with a term ending 12/31/2024 pending Village Board approval 
made by Donna Patchen, seconded by Kathleen LaClair. Motion carried. 



3. Motion to appoint Tom Williams as Planning Board Alternate, effective 
immediately with a term ending 12/31/2024 pending Village Board approval 
made by Donna Patchen, seconded by Kathleen LaClair. Motion carried. 

b. BAR: 
Motion to re-appoint Mike Pavlot as a Board of Assessment Review member for 
a 5-year term effective 11/1/2023 to 9/30/2028 made by Kenneth Knapp, 
seconded by Kathleen LaClair. Motion carried. 

c. Highway Department: 
Motion to appoint John Keszler for part-time plowing at the rate of $20.00/hour 
effective 11/1/2023 made by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by Kathleen LaClair. 
Motion carried. 

       d.    Poet Laureate:  
Motion to appoint Thomas Hunt as Poet Laureate for a 3-year term pending 
Village approval made by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by Kathleen LaClair. Motion 
carried. 

E. Training:  
a. A motion was made by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by James Kenney to approve Sandra 
McMullen: 2023 Crosswalk LG Workshop in Watertown 11/16/2023 with a registration 
fee of $45. Motion carried. 

F. Fireworks Applications:  
a. 1000 Islands Harbor Municipal- 

i. Motion to approve 1000 Islands Harbor Hotel Fire & Ice Event Permit made by 
Kathleen LaClair, seconded Kenneth Knapp.  Motion carried. 
ii. Motion to approve use of Harbor Municipal dock attenuator for the Fire & Ice 
fireworks made by Kathleen LaClair, seconded by Kenneth Knapp. Motion 
carried. 

b. Clayton Chamber of Commerce- 
i. Motion to approve Clayton Chamber of Commerce Christmas Parade fireworks 
permit made by Kathleen LaClair, seconded by Kenneth Knapp. Motion carried.  
ii. Motion to permit Clayton Chamber of Commerce use of Harbor Municipal 
dock attenuator for the Christmas parade fireworks by Kathleen LaClair, 
seconded by Kenneth Knapp. Motion carried. 
iii. Motion to waive $200 firework permit fee for Clayton Chamber Christmas 
parade fireworks permit on account of being a non-profit organization made by 
Donna Patchen, seconded by James Kenney. Motion carried. 

G. 2024 RFP for Miscellaneous Contractors 
a. Miscellaneous Hourly Construction Work at Town Facilities: 

 
i. Motion was made to award Carpenter and Painter bids to LP Builders by James 
Kenney, seconded by Kenneth Knapp. Peterson- abstained; LaClair- aye; Patchen- aye; 
Knapp- aye; Kenney- aye. Motion carried.  

Hourly Rate Daily Rate Hourly Rate Daily Rate Hourly Rate Daily Rate

Carpenter $92.00 $736.00 $125.00 $1,000.00 NO BID NO BID

Electrician NO BID NO BID $125.00 $1,000.00 NO BID NO BID

Plumber NO BID NO BID $125.00 $1,000.00 $102.00 NO BID

Mason NO BID NO BID $125.00 $1,000.00 NO BID NO BID

Painter $92.00 $736.00 $125.00 $1,000.00 NO BID NO BID

LP BUILDERS NEW CENTURY ELECTRIC HYDE STONE MECHANICALS



ii. Motion was made to award Electrician and Mason bids to New Century by Kenneth 
Knapp, seconded by James Kenney. Motion carried. 
iii. Motion was to award Plumbing bid to Hyde Stone by Kathleen LaClair, seconded by 
Kenneth Knapp. Motion carried. 
 

b. Pest Control: 

 
Motion to award Pest Control Services to Jenis Pest Control by Kenneth Knapp, 
seconded by Kathleen LaClair. Motion carried. 
 

c. Lift Station & Sewage Treatment Plant Work: 

 
Motion to award lift station and sewage treatment plant work to Docteur 
Environmental made by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by Kathleen Knapp. Motion carried. 
 

d. Septic Tank Pump Out & Hauling: 

 
Motion was made to award Pomerville Services on Septic Tank Pump Out and Hauling 
by Kathleen LaClair, seconded by Donna Patchen. Motion carried. 
 
 
 
 

Regular Hourly Rate $120.00 /hr

Overtime & Saturday Rate $120.00 /hr

Sunday & Holiday Rate $120.00 /hr

Overhead & Profit Markup Percentage on Supplies 0 %

JENIS PEST CONTROL

Lump Sum for Semi-Annual Preventative Maintenance/Inspection $2,600.00 /Lump Sum

Regular Hourly Rate $120.00 /hr

Overtime & Saturday Rate $150.00 /hr

Sunday & Holiday Rate $150.00 /hr

Emergency Call Rate $150.00 /hr

Overhead & Profit Markup Percentage on Supplies 20 %

DOCTEUR ENVIRONMENTAL

20 Residential Septic Tanks @ $325.00 /Tank

3 Commercial Septic Tanks @ $375.00 /Tank

Total Bid $7,625.00

Weekday business hours 7:00 AM to 3:30 PM for Residential Tanks         $325.00 /Tank

Weekday business hours 7:00 AM to 3:30 PM for Commercial Tanks       $375.00 /Tank

Overtime hours on Weekday and for Saturdays for Residential Tanks         $450.00 /Tank

Overtime hours on Weekday and for Saturdays for Commercial Tanks $450.00 /Tank

Overtime hours on Sundays and Holidays for Residential Tanks $450.00 /Tank

Overtime hours on Sundays and Holidays for Commercial Tanks $450.00 /Tank

POMERVILLE SEPTIC 



e. Marine Transportation to & from Grindstone Island: 

 
Motion was made to award Marine Transportation to and from Grindstone Island to RJ 

Marine by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by James Kenney. Motion carried. 

f. Mowing Maintenance at Two Cemeteries on Grindstone Island & Grindstone Island 
Schoolhouse: 

 
Motion was made to award mowing maintenance at two cemeteries on Grindstone 
Island and Grindstone Island Schoolhouse to Charles Smith by Kenneth Knapp, seconded 
by Kathleen LaClair. Motion carried. 
 

g. HVAC Preventative Maintenance at listed Town-owned Facilities: 

 
Motion to award HVAC Preventative Maintenance at listed Town-owned Facilities 
awarded to Hyde-Stone by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by Donna Patchen. Motion 
carried. 

 
h. Material Supply Hourly Construction (Requested by the ton): 

 
Motion made by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by Kathleen LaClair to award material supply 
to Clayton Sand and Gravel taking exception to the requirements that bids need to be 
submitted by the ton and Clayton Sand and Gravel bid per 12-yards. Motion carried.  
 
 

Cost per One-Way Loaded Trip: $280.00 /Trip

Cost per Two-Way Loaded Trip: $280.00 /Trip

Cost for Wait Time After 30 Minutes $200.00 /hr

RJ MARINE

Mowing both Cemeteries and Schoolhouse for one season $9,500.00 /Lump Sum

CHARLES SMITH

Regular Hourly Rate $102.00 /hr

Contract Rate for non-routine Service Call-out:

Normal weekday business hours 7:00 AM to 3:30 PM $102.00 /hr

Overtime hours on Weekday and for Saturdays $153.00 /hr

Overtime hours on Sundays and Holidays $204.00 /hr

HYDE STONE MECHANICALS

CLAYTON SAND AND GRAVEL

Road Traction Material

200 Truck Loads @ 18 tons/tl= 3,600 tons $108.00 /12 YARDS

3/4 “ Minus Processed Gravel

4 Truck Loads @ 18 tons/tl = 72 tons $132.00 /12 YARDS

2” Minus Processed Gravel

4 Truck Loads @ 18 tons/tl = 72 tons $120.00 /12 YARDS

Unprocessed Bank Run Gravel (Nominal 4" Gravel)

4 Truck Loads @ 18 tons/tl =72 tons $96.00 /12 YARDS



H. DOCKWA Agreement: 
Motion to approve the annual cost of $7,776 per year for the next three years for the 
DOCKWA software services agreement for the Harbor Municipal Marina made by Donna 
Patchen, seconded by Kathleen LaClair. Motion carried. 

I. Budget Workshop: No concerns at this time. 
J. Resolution to Adopt 2024 Section 284 Highway Expenditure Plan  

Resolution #51 of 2023, a resolution to Adopt the 2024 Section 284 Agreement for the 
Expenditure of Highway Funds introduced by James Kenney, seconded by Donna Patchen. 
Patchen-aye; LaClair-aye; Kenney- aye; Knapp – aye; Peterson-aye. Passed. 

K. Resolution to Adopt 2024 Budget 
Resolution #52 of 2023, a resolution to Adopt the 2024 Town of Clayton Budget introduced 
by Donna Patchen, seconded by Kathleen LaClair. Patchen-aye; LaClair-aye; Knapp – aye; 
Kenney- aye; Peterson- aye. Passed. 

L. November 22, 2023 Meeting Cancellation 
Motion to cancel the November 22, 2023 meeting made by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by 
Kathleen LaClair.  Motion carried. 

M. December 27, 2023 Meeting  
Motion to move the December 27, 2023 meeting to December 29, 2023 at 8:00 AM to the 
Town Offices, 405 Riverside Dr., Clayton, NY made by Kathleen LaClair, seconded by Donna 
Patchen. Motion carried. 

 
6. Supervisor’s Report: N/A 
 
7. Department Head Reports: 

A. Highway Superintendent: Steve Dorr- Crew has been working on Black Creek Rd. At this time, 
trucks are ready for winter weather, continuing to work on ditches and pipe work as well as tree 
removal. 
B. Buildings & Grounds: James Jones- Attended a meeting with CCE in regard to composting, will 
be attending another meeting for follow-up.   
C. Assessor: Alexander Marchenkoff- N/A 
D. Codes/Zoning: Richard Ingerson-N/A 

 
8. Council Reports 

• Councilman Knapp: Nothing to report.  

• Councilwoman Patchen: See Buildings & Grounds 

• Councilman Kenney: Depauville Hotel has begun construction on rebuilding from fire. 

• Councilwoman LaClair: Housing study has been released. 
 

9. Public: N/A 
 
10. Executive Session: 
Motion by Kenneth Knapp, seconded by Kathleen LaClair to enter into executive session regarding 
OML§105(f) the medical, financial, credit or employment history of a particular person or corporation, 
or matters leading to the appointment, employment, promotion, demotion, discipline, suspension, 
dismissal or removal of a particular person or corporation. Motion carried.  
 
Motion by Kathleen LaClair, seconded by James Kenney to close executive session at 5:58pm. Motion 
carried. 



 
Motion by Kenneth Knapp second by James Kenney to open the regular meeting at 5:58 pm. Motion 
carried. 
 
11. Adjournment: 
Motion was made by Kathleen LaClair, seconded by James Kenney to adjourn at 5:59 PM. Motion carried. 
 
Next Meeting: Wednesday, December 13, 2023 at 5:00PM at the Cerow Recreation Park Arena, 600 East 

Line Rd., Clayton, NY. 

Megan Badour, Town Clerk 






















